

		- denotes low quote for that chemical from this set of quotes - denotes renewal at previous year's price											
Vendor		PAC (EC309, or equal)	Alum	Caustic Soda	Chlorine		Fluoride	Potassium Permanganate	Phosphate	Solar Salt*	Sulfur Dioxide	WWTP Sludge Dewatering	WTP Cationic Polymer
Annual Supply Estimated Quantity (FY2025)		250	750	290	140	20	60	12,000	100,000	960	9,000	50,000	30,000
Units for Estimated Quantity		tons	tons	tons	tons	each	tons	lbs.	lbs.	tons	lbs.	lbs	lbs
Units for quotation		(\$ per ton)	(\$ per dry ton)	(\$ per dry ton)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per 150 lb cyl)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per lb)
Brenntag Mid-South, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$710.00 \$205,900.00	\$1,436.00 \$201,040.00	\$179.25 \$3,585.00	No Bid No Bid	2.1900 \$26,280.00	No Bid No Bid	260.00 \$249,600.00	\$1.1900 \$10,710.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
C & S Chemicals	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	\$280.00 \$210,000.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Carus, LLC	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid \$58,800.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
CedarChem LLC	unit price est. extended price	\$604.00 \$151,000.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$1,7750 \$88,750.00	\$1,7750 \$53,250.00
Chemrite, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$2.0680 \$24,816.00	\$0.5640 \$56,400.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	unit price est. extended price	\$603.00 \$150,750.00	\$279.50 \$209,625.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
CoreChem, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$286.00 \$274,560.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Harcros Chemicals	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$1,440.00 \$201,600.00	\$180.75 \$3,615.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Penco, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$504.00 \$30,240.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Scotwood Industries, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$281.00 \$269,760.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$0.5650 \$56,500.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
United Mineral & Chemical Corp.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$2.0700 \$24,840.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Univar Solutions USA, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	\$445.00 \$333,750.00	\$713.00 \$206,770.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$505.00 \$30,300.00	\$2.1800 \$26,160.00	No Bid No Bid	\$260.50 \$250,080.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Water Solutions Unlimited	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Zeta Solutions	unit price est. extended price	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	\$0.6024 \$60,240.00	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid	No Bid No Bid
Chemical Year 2025 Annual Cost	unit price	\$144,250.00	\$213,000.00	\$242,730.00	\$237,720.00	\$3,615.00	\$32,400.00	\$26,928.00	\$75,240.00	\$283,200.00	\$10,800.00	\$88,750.00	\$53,250.00
Increase/Decrease for Chemical Year 2024 (%)	est. extended price	4.5%	-1.6%	-15.2%	-15.4%	-0.8%	-6.7%	-7.8%	-25.0%	-11.7%	-0.8%	0.0%	0.0%