
Gadsden Water Works and Sewer Board

Water Treatment Chemical Quotations (for the period August 1, 2023 - July 31, 2024)

Quotes received 6/29/23

- denotes low quote for that chemical from this set of quotes

- denotes renewal at previous year's price

Vendor

PAC (EC309, or 

equal) Alum Caustic Soda Fluoride

Potassium 

Permanganate Phosphate Solar Salt* Sulfur Dioxide

WWTP Sludge 

Dewatering 

WTP Cationic 

Polymer

Annual Supply Estimated Quantity (FY2024) 250 1,500 290 140 20 60 12,000 100,000 960 9,000 50,000 30,000

Units for Estimated Quantity tons tons tons tons each tons lbs. lbs. tons lbs. lbs lbs
Units for quotation ($ per ton) ($ per dry ton) ($ per dry ton) ($ per ton) ($ per 150 lb cyl) ($ per ton) ($ per lb) ($ per lb) ($ per ton) ($ per lb) ($ per lb) ($ per lb)

Brenntag Mid-South, Inc. unit price No Bid No Bid $838.00 $1,725.00 $180.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.2000 No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $243,020.00 $241,500.00 $3,615.00 $10,800.00

C & S Chemicals unit price No Bid $284.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $426,000.00

Carus, LLC unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.7600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $76,000.00

CedarChem LLC unit price $578.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.7750 $1.7750

est. extended price $144,500.00 $88,750.00 $53,250.00

Chemrite, Inc. unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.2440 $0.7524 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $26,928.00 $75,240.00

Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC unit price $577.00 $284.75 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $144,250.00 $427,125.00

Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc. unit price No Bid No Bid $933.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $270,570.00

CoreChem, Inc. unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $298.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $286,080.00

Harcros Chemicals unit price No Bid No Bid $949.98 $1,698.00 $187.50 No Bid $2.7900 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $275,494.20 $237,720.00 $3,750.00 $33,480.00

Pencco, Inc. unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $549.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $32,970.00

Scotwood Industries, Inc. unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $296.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $284,160.00

Shannon Chemical Corporation unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.0000 $0.8500 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $36,000.00 $85,000.00

United Mineral & Chemical Corp. unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.4600 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $29,520.00

Univar Solutions USA, Inc. unit price No Bid $401.90 $837.00 No Bid No Bid $540.00 $3.1400 No Bid $295.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $602,850.00 $242,730.00 $32,400.00 $37,680.00 $283,200.00

Water Solutions Unlimitied unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.2450 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $26,940.00

Zeta Solutions unit price No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.7534 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

est. extended price $75,340.00

Chemical Year 2023 Annual Cost unit price $122,500.00 $628,875.00 $289,971.00 $280,000.00 $3,945.00 $31,200.00 $31,188.00 $125,000.00 $316,800.00 $9,000.00 $92,000.00 $53,700.00

Increase/Decrease for Chemical Year 2023 (%)est. extended price 17.8% -32.3% -16.3% -15.1% -8.4% 3.8% -13.7% -39.8% -10.6% -100.0% -3.5% -0.8%

Chlorine


