

Gadsden Water Works and Sewer Board
 Water Treatment Chemical Quotations
 Quotes received 7/27/21

(for the period August 1, 2021 - January 31, 2022)

		- denotes low quote for that chemical from this set of quotes										
		- denotes renewal at previous year's price										
Vendor		PAC (EC309)	Alum	Caustic Soda	Chlorine		Fluoride	Potassium Permanganate	Phosphate	Solar Salt*	Sulfur Dioxide	WWTP Sludge Dewatering
Annual Supply Estimated Quantity (FY2022)		250	1,500	290	140	20	60	12,000	100,000	960	9,000	50,000
Units for Estimated Quantity		tons	tons	tons	tons	each	tons	lbs.	lbs.	tons	lbs.	lbs.
Units for quotation		(\$ per lb)	(\$ per dry ton)	(\$ per dry ton)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per 150 lb cyl)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per ton)
American International Chemical (AIC)	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Allied Universal Corporation	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Brenntag Mid-South, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$804.27 \$112,597.80	\$108.60 \$2,172.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.6361 \$5,724.90	No Bid
Carus Corporation	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CedarChem LLC	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.3620 \$68,100.00
Chemrite	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.8900 \$22,680.00	\$0.6900 \$69,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	unit price est. extended price	\$0.189875 \$94,937.50	\$273.24 \$409,860.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CoreChem	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$225.00 \$216,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
C&S Chemicals, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
GEO Specialty Chemicals, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dycho Company, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Gulbrandsen Technologies, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Marubeni Specialty Chemicals	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Penco, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$465.00 \$27,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Scotwood Industries, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Specialty Chemical Company, LLC	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Univar USA Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	\$625.00 \$181,250.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$455.00 \$27,300.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Chemical Year 2021 Annual Cost	unit price	\$94,937.50	\$409,860.00	\$159,500.00	\$73,397.80	\$1,751.00	\$16,680.00	\$19,068.00	\$41,900.00	\$183,360.00	\$5,274.90	\$65,475.00
Increase for Chemical Year 2022 (%)	est. extended price	-	-	13.6%	53.4%	24.0%	63.7%	18.9%	64.7%	17.8%	8.5%	4.0%