

- denotes low quote for that chemical from this set of quotes

Vendor		PAC (EC309)	Alum	Caustic Soda	Chlorine		Fluoride	Potassium Permanganate	Phosphate	Solar Salt*	Sulfur Dioxide	Dewatering Polymer
Annual Supply Estimated Quantity (FY2018)		250	1,500	290	140	20	60	12,000	100,000	960	9,000	25
Units for Estimated Quantity		tons	tons	tons	tons	each	tons	lbs.	lbs.	tons	lbs.	tons
Units for quotation		(\$ per lb)	(\$ per dry ton)	(\$ per dry ton)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per 150 lb cyl)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per ton)	(\$ per lb)	(\$ per ton)
American International Chemical (AIC)	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.6800 \$20,160.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Allied Universal Corporation	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	\$582.75 \$168,997.50	\$405.33 \$56,746.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.58 \$5,220.00	No Bid
Brenntag Mid-South, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	\$546.00 \$158,340.00	\$405.00 \$56,700.00	\$67.50 \$1,350.00	No Bid	\$1.6300 \$19,560.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.56 \$5,040.00	No Bid
Carus Corporation	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.326 \$32,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CedarChem LLC	unit price est. extended price	\$0.1400 \$70,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2,100.00 \$52,500.00
Chemrite	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.5510 \$18,612.00	\$0.335 \$33,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	unit price est. extended price	\$0.1144 \$57,200.00	\$229.50 \$344,250.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
CoreChem	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$191.25 \$183,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
C&S Chemicals, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	\$230.00 \$345,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Dycho Company, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$302.00 \$18,120.00	\$1.7200 \$20,640.00	No Bid	\$227.60 \$218,496.00	No Bid	No Bid
Gulbrandsen Technologies, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	\$0.1147 \$57,350.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Marubeni Specialty Chemicals	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.5521 \$18,625.20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Pencco, Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$270.00 \$16,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Shannon Chemical Corporation	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.6200 \$19,440.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Specialty Chemical Company, LLC	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	\$545.00 \$158,050.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Univar USA Inc.	unit price est. extended price	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$271.00 \$16,260.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$195.00 \$187,200.00	No Bid	No Bid