

- denotes low quote for that chemical from this set of quotes

| Vendor | | PAC (EC309) | Alum | Caustic Soda | Chlorine | | Fluoride | Phosphate | Solar Salt* | Potassium Permanganate | Sulfur Dioxide | WWTP Sludge Dewatering |
|---|-----------------------------------|-------------------------|--------------------------|--------------------------|-------------------------|------------------------|-------------------------|-------------------------|--------------------------|------------------------|------------------------|---------------------------|
| Annual Supply Estimated Quantity (FY2017) | | 250 | 1,500 | 290 | 140 | 20 | 60 | 100,000 | 960 | 12,000 | 9,000 | 25 |
| Units for Estimated Quantity | | tons | tons | tons | tons | each | tons | lbs. | tons | lbs. | lbs. | tons |
| Units for quotation | | (\$ per lb) | (\$ per dry ton) | (\$ per dry ton) | (\$ per ton) | (\$ per 150 lb cyl) | (\$ per ton) | (\$ per lb) | (\$ per ton) | (\$ per lb) | (\$ per lb) | (\$ per ton) |
| AIC | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$1.84 \$22,080.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Allied Universal Corporation | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | \$433.00 \$125,570.00 | No Bid | \$110.00 \$2,200.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$0.6334 \$5,700.60 | No Bid |
| Brenntag Mid-South | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | \$270.00 \$405,000.00 | \$429.00 \$124,410.00 | \$398.00 \$55,720.00 | \$59.00 \$1,180.00 | \$405.00 \$24,300.00 | \$0.365 \$36,500.00 | No Bid | \$3.96 \$47,520.00 | \$0.565 \$5,085.00 | No Bid |
| Carus Corporation | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$0.35 \$35,000.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| CedarChem LLC | unit price est. extended price | \$0.1525 \$76,250.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$1.94 \$23,280.00 | No Bid | \$2,120.00 \$53,000.00 |
| Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC | unit price est. extended price | \$0.147 \$73,500.00 | \$218.50 \$327,750.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| C&S Chemicals | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | \$273.00 \$409,500.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Dycho Company, Inc. | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | \$369.40 \$554,100.00 | \$405.59 \$117,621.10 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$195.80 \$187,968.00 | \$2.10 \$25,200.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| F2 Industries, LLC | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$0.42 \$42,000.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| GEO Specialty Chemicals, Inc. | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | \$389.95 \$584,925.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$1.98 \$23,760.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Harcros Chemicals, Inc. | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | \$525.00 \$152,250.00 | \$550.00 \$77,000.00 | \$75.00 \$1,500.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Industrial Chemicals, Inc. | unit price est. extended price | \$0.172 \$86,000.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$1.99 \$23,880.00 | No Bid | \$2,240.00 \$56,000.00 |
| Morton Salt, Inc. | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$176.50 \$169,440.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Mosaic Global Sales, LLC | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$328.00 \$19,680.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Shannon Chemical Corporation | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$597.97 \$35,878.20 | \$0.353 \$35,300.00 | No Bid | \$1.78 \$21,360.00 | No Bid | No Bid |
| Specialty Chemical Company, LLC | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | \$488.00 \$141,520.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Sterling Water Technologies LLC | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | \$0.3669 \$36,690.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid |
| Univar USA Inc. | unit price est. extended price | No Bid | \$305.00 \$457,500.00 | \$465.00 \$134,850.00 | No Bid | No Bid | \$339.67 \$20,380.20 | No Bid | No Bid | \$2.10 \$25,200.00 | No Bid | No Bid |